THERE IS NO LEGAL OBJECTION TO THIS LEGISLATION IF AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

1. In the title, beginning in line 2, strike “Four Hundred Sixty-Five Thousand
Dollars ($465,000)"” and insert “Four Hundred Thousand Dollars ($400,000)".

2. In Section 1, lines 1 and 2, strike "659-2026-A, of Four Hundred Sixty-
Five Thousand Dollars ($465,000)” and insert "659-2026-B, of Four Hundred
Thousand Dollars ($400,000)".

3. In Section 1, in the table, at "General Government” at “Council & Clerk
of Council” at "I Personnel and Related Expenses” in the “Transfer From” column,
strike “$325,000” and insert “$260,000”; and in at “"Total General Government”, in
the “Transfer From” column, strike “$465,000” and insert “$400,000".

4, In Section 1, in the table, at "Non-Departmental” at "Transfers to other
Funds” at “II Other Expenses”, in the “Transfer To"” column, strike “$325,000” and
insert “"$260,000”; at “Total Executive Branch” in both columns, strike “$465,000”
and insert “$400,000” in both places; and at “TOTAL GENERAL FUND"” in both
columns, strike “$465,000” and insert “$400,000" in both places.

Date: (Signed):

Vishnu Ganglani
Assistant Director of Law

Ord. No. 659-2026



