
THERE IS NO LEGAL OBJECTION TO THIS LEGISLATION IF AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
 
 
 1. In the title, lines 2 and 3; and in the first whereas clause, line 2, strike 
“Twenty Million Dollars ($20,000,000)” and insert “Fifteen Million Dollars ($15,000,000)” 
in both places. 
 
 2. In Section 1, at “General Fund”, at “II. Other Expenses”, at “TOTAL NON-
DEPARTMENTAL” and at “TOTAL GENERAL FUND”, strike “$20,000,000” and insert 
“$15,000,000” in all four places. 
 
 3. Insert a new Section 2 to read as follows: 
 “Section 2.  That the Director of Finance, or his representative, shall return to the 
Finance Committee no later than April 30, 2025, to update Council Members on the 
replenishment of Fund No. 10 SF 400.”. 
 
 4. Renumber existing Section 2 to new “Section 3”. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Date:  _______  (Signed):  _______________________________________ 
    Vishnu Ganglani 
    Assistant Director of Law 
 
Ord. No. 1249-2024 


