
THERE IS NO LEGAL OBJECTION TO THIS LEGISLATION IF AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
 
 
 1. In the title, strike lines 4, 5, and 6 in their entirety and insert the 
following:  “($2,450,000) to the General Fund and One Million One”. 
 
 2. In the first whereas clause, lines 1 and 2, strike “Four Million Two 
Hundred Thirty One Thousand Dollars ($4,231,000)” and insert “Three Million Six 
Hundred Thousand Dollars ($3,600,000)”. 
 
 3. In Section 1, in the table, strike line 2 in its entirety which reads “SPECIAL 
REVENUE FUND $631,000” and at line 4 at “TOTAL ALL FUNDS”, strike “$4,231,000” 
and insert “$3,600,000”; in the table, strike lines 11 through 16 in their entirety, which 
begins with “SPECIAL REVENUE FUND”; and the last line of the table, strike 
“$4,231,000” and insert “$3,600,000”. 
 
 
Date:  _______  (Signed):  _______________________________________ 
    Jason Shachner 
    Assistant Director of Law 
Ord. No. 795-2023 


